
IRCCS-ISMETT  
is issuing a call for applications for the following fixed-term position: 

 
1 Biomedical Laboratory Technician 

(Ref. TLB/18 TD) 
 
Under the supervision of the Laboratory Technicians Coordinator, the Biomedical 
Laboratory Technician is responsible for technical management of all pre-
analytical, analytical, and post-analytical phases of the Laboratory. The 
Biomedical Laboratory Technician checks for service compliance with diagnostic 
protocol standards, appropriateness of samples, efficiency of instruments and 
reagents, and quality audit outcomes. He/she also offers technical support along 
the various steps of diagnostic and research tests. 
 
Requisites: 
All applicants expected to possess the following requisites: 

• University degree of Biomedical Laboratory Technician (recognized in 
Italy) or equivalent title under the current laws. 
 

Preferred qualifications: 

• Experience in medium-large laboratories equipped for research activity 
finalizing routine and specialty diagnostic tests.   
 

The ideal candidate is familiar with the diagnostic methods and instrumentation 
most commonly utilized in clinical pathology, clinical biochemistry, hematology 
and coagulation, clinical immunology, microbiology and virology, and molecular 
biology. The ideal candidate also has a good knowledge of English and main 
computer applications. 
 
Good stress management, flexibility and team working abilities, confidentiality, 
and time management and problem solving skills complete the profile. 
 
Only applicants who are not excluded under the provisions articulated in 
Legislative decree 165/2001, Art. 53, para. 16-ter, and subsequent modifications 
and amendments, can participate in this selection (General Rules Governing the 
Work of Public Administrations). 
 
The workplace is Palermo. 
 
Additional information on this call for applications will be posted in the "Job 
Opportunities" section (www.ismett.edu).   
 
The date and location of the tests and/or interviews will be published on 
www.ismett.edu. Candidates will be expected to access this information from the 
website. Candidates failing to show up for the tests and/or interviews on the 
scheduled day, time, and location will be excluded from the selection, whatever 



the cause of their absence, even if these are beyond their control or due to 
causes not ascribable to them. 
 
IRCCS ISMETT reserves its right of discretion to the fullest extent permitted by 
law in assessing the candidates and the eligibility of their applications.  
 
After reading the privacy statement and authorizing the processing of their 
personal data (Legislative decree 196/2003), applicants of either sex (Law 
903/77) are requested to fill out the on-line application form available at   
indicating the reference code. When filling out the on-line application form, 
applicants will be requested to attach their CV. At the end of the process, 
applicants will also be requested to state, by means of a self-declaration, their 
possession of the requisites listed in this call for applications.  
 
 
The deadline to submit the applications is September 26, 2018. 
 
Please note that only applications submitted on-line will be taken into 
consideration (http://selezioni.ismett.edu/). 
 
Also, please note that selection records are confidential documents for internal 
use only, and may not be disclosed. 
 
All applicants are obliged, at any time during the selection process, and if 
requested by ISMETT, to provide the documentation certifying the stated 
possession of the requisites within the requested deadline. Should any 
preliminary verification show a discrepancy with any statement submitted by the 
applicant, the latter will be excluded from the selection process, and any 
negotiation deemed permanently suspended.  
 
IRCCS ISMETT reserves the right to revoke this selection if the reasons that led 
the company to start this process no longer exists, or due to technical, 
organizational or financial reasons, which would make this selection no longer 
compliant with the company’s interests. 
 
Personal data included in the CV will be processed by IRCCS ISMETT and 
UPMC Italy or associated companies for selections for this or other similar 
positions. Applicants are requested not to include sensitive data (e.g., health 
status), unless strictly necessary. Detailed information also with reference to data 
storage times and rights recognized under Decree 196/2003, are available at 
www.ismett.edu and www.upmcitaly.it in the "Job Opportunities" section. 


